iMessage
Jan 8, 2020 at 14:20

Hi mike - you here? I'm at your door

Jan 13, 2020 at 14:58

Hi, Merry. Jeremy is traveling and hopes to respond by
tomorrow. kathy says she didn't see our emails. | sent her
both of them. Hopefully the will respond soon. | know
Massimo is really busy at work, but | reached out to him for
a response. Democracy takes a lot of work. Even at this
level.

Jan 14, 2020 at 13:45

- @ Vikram Shah.vcf
— Contact Card - 204 bytes

Hi Merry. This is the most recent address | have for Vikram.
He just lives across the street from you. Would you like me
to introduce you to him via email? Or do you just want to
get a hold of him? Thanks a lot For volunteering to take the
website management on. He is the guy with all of the
passwords.

Jan 16, 2020 at 16:40

Hi Merry. | am home until about 5:10, and then | need to go
pick up my son. If you have time, could you give me a call?
Otherwise maybe we could talk in the morning tomorrow
between eight and 9307 | am frustrated by the lack of
responses from Rich, Kathy and Jeremy, and | would like to
keep this deck thing moving forward. We have been stuck
since November. Thanks!

Jan 30, 2020 at 15:51

Hi mike - could look at fence now. My sisters visiting and
we could walk over. Text back if yes

Jan 30, 2020 at 16:53



Hi Merry. Just got in from a run. | could go out right now
and spend 15 or 20 minutes. Probably didn’t take that long.
I'm also pretty flexible tomorrow including in the morning.
And afternoon as well.

Jeremy said ok tomorrow afternoon. | suggested 2:30

That sounds good. Be good to meet with both of you.
Maybe we can get Massimo on board, too.

Ok

Feb 5, 2020 at 09:26

Good morning Merry. Would you have any time this
morning to chat? | wanted to brief you on a conversation |
had with Susan Fey yesterday, at her urging. It would be
great if you felt like coming over here, for coffee or tea, or
you could just give me a call at 303 818-2873. Thanks!

Feb 5, 2020 at 11:44

Not urgent. I'm glad that Susan is communicating with us!
Have a good rest of your day.

Text Message - SMS
Mar 27, 2020 at 16:26

13038182873 Depositing new message This message

could not be reliably transcribed. Click here: 13608424015
to listen to full voice message.

iMessage
Aug 23, 2020 at 10:52




| believe | registered with the correct link?

Nov 8, 2020 at 20:35

Hi, Merry,Begin forwarded message:

From: Michael McMillen <mike@mmcmillen.com>
Subject: Re: sc7hoa.org iN-Command sc7hoa (Legacy
Basic Nonprofit)

Date: November 1, 2020 at 12:39:53 PM MST

To: Merry Bullock <merrybullock@mac.com>

Hi, Merry,

| hope you and Bruce are staying healthy and otherwise
doing well!

| just received a bill from InfoTeam. As per our
conversations last March, | believe we were going to stay
with InfoTeam for web hosting. Have you made any
payments to them, or have you been paying another
company for our HOA web hosting? | just wanted to check
with you before | pay this bill.

Thanks,

Mike

Michael G. McMillen
(303).818-2873
<mailto:mike@mmcmillen.com>

Dear Mike McMillen,

Statement 65350-12 for your account from Nov 1, 2020
12:00:00 AM through Nov 1, 2020 3:10:07 AM
Login:sc7hoa

AnnAniin + IN-COCN



ACCUUIIL IV-O0O0O0V
Plan:Legacy Basic Nonprofit

Annual fee for Legacy Basic Nonprofit plan (11/1/20 -
11/1/21) $44.70

TOTAL: $44.70
YOUR CURRENT BALANCE: ($268.20)

If the amount shown in "YOUR CURRENT BALANCE:"
above is in parentheses () then a payment is required. If
the amount is NOT in parentheses, then you have a credit
balance and no payment is due at this time.

To replenish your balance, send your check to: InfoTeam
Corporation

4290 Ridgewood Rd.

Copley, OH 44321

Make checks payable to: InfoTeam Corporation

NOTE: If you choose to pay monthly by check, your
payment

must be received at least 10 DAYS PRIOR to each monthly
due

date to allow for processing and to avoid possible account
suspension.

If you have any questions on the above, contact us at:
mailto:billing@infoteam.com or use the Support Center in
your control panel.

Feb 21, 2021 at 13:32

Hi mike where is Andreas house?
1003 tpc. Silver Toyota truck in drive. See you there at 2?
Yup

Dec 2, 2021 at 10:24

Hi, Merry. Sorry for all of the emails, but it's been really
difficult trying to schedule this meeting with the lawyer.

I AAninA tAnniAarde nAat mAantinAa tAAd A AanA frvinAa fAr D DA



LTallllly tuvwaiud 11VL 1HITTLUI Y tvuay aliu LU yllly vl £ rivi

tomorrow.

That is ok too for me

Just let me know

Dec 2, 2021 at 11:52

No meeting today but hoping for a meeting at 2 PM
tomorrow.

Dec 16, 2021 at 12:30

Hi Merry! Did you just send me the message | copied in
below? | just received it in an email from you. I'm betting
it's a scam. Hope you are doing well!

W Verizon ¥ 12:29 PM < 85% (@m)
<O Vv
. Merry Bullock 12:27 PM
To: Michael G McMillen >

Re: Request

| am in a meeting right now as | would be
working till late evening

but need you to get me some gift cards. Could
you pick a few iTunes

gifts cards for me, when I'm done with the
meeting, | will reimburse

you.

Let me know if you can handle this.

Sent from my iPad

Are you free at the moment?

Sent from my iPad



Ty - A o

Of course you didn't send it. | double checked the email
address and it wasn't yours.

Standard spam

But tell the others on the board. They may get it too

Mar 19, 2022 at 12:23

Hi, Merry. Are you around today? | would like to hand you
the hardcopies of Tom Morris' architectural review form, |
wanted the hardcopies to be available to the board in case
it's time for an approval before | return in a week. (I signed
off on it a couple of weeks ago before Massimo raised
objections.)

Yes | am. We are going out in about 20 minutes
Coming...

Oct 14, 2022 at 20:01

| think she has already moved out. Might be a good move.
Glad we live all the way across the neighborhood. In Aspen
for the weekend. Hope you have a good one!

Nov 2, 2022 at 11:08

Verizon & 11:07 AM 7 ¢ 69% @)
< Inbox ANV
Merry Bulloc 9:22 AM
W’ To: M McMiller

Payment Request

Hello Mike
I will need you to make a wire transfer of $3000

Let me know when you are available, so I can send
the bank details.

kind regards
Merry Bullock



Sent from my iPad

N

Ty B K

Do you take cash?(&)

Nov 2, 2022 at 13:18

Lol!'! Another spam. | only take bitcoin

Fri, Sep 19 at 09:19

Hi Merry! | just got an email about canceling our SC7
website registration. Hoping it's spam? Are you around
Boulder these days? We should talk sometime soon about
some logistical things concerning the HOA.

Sat, Sep 20 at 08:03

I'm around next week.

Let's do it. Also have a huge box of hoa papers!!

Sat, Sep 20 at 10:27

Hi Merry! | am mostly around next week. Let's be in touch
about getting together. | bet we could get Jamie in there
too since he's pretty much committed to being the
treasurer. If you considered renting out your property?
Julia and | rent out her townhouse in gunbarrel and it's
worked out great so far. We are lucky to have a really good
elderly tenant. (as in, even older than | am.)

Fri. Sep 26 at 14:29



Hi saw the request for the hoa letter. I'll do it because they
said they wanted it asap. That ok? What did you put for
reserves? Our dues are paid.

| think | put down $100,000. I'll be home in 40 minutes and
can check for sure. If you want to do it, go for it. Thanks! |
believe they did say October 6 or something on the email
that | got...

| know but then they wanted sooner
They also want last 6 mo of minutes

Just got home. | will check Google Docs and see what kind
of minutes | can find.

Meeting Minutes_06162025.doc
Word Document - 43 KB

Meeting Minutes_03172025 Final.doc
Word Document - 40 KB

Hi, Merry. This would be what we have going back 6
months. Need anything else??

Fri, Sep 26 at 17:56

THANK YOU - | will complete everything and copy you on
the letter where | attach it all (they want financial docs and
budget etc)

Fri, Sep 26 at 19:39

Thank you, Merry! And congratulations on the sale!

Thursday 15:07

Hi merry. Jamie was on his way over there, but | got a hold
of him. Did you mention next Wednesday would work for
you? That would work with Jamie and me, too. Maybe early



mid afternoon next Wednesday? FYI: | just got his phone
number off of our webpage since | didn't have a phone
number for him. Hope you're having a good one today!

Ok let's say 2 pm next Wednesday. Having pretty full day.
Moving sucks!!

Read Thursday

Today 12:59

Hi, Merry. | just spoke with Julie from land title. You will be
credited back the prorated amount. Sorry for any
confusion. I've never done these status letters. | think
we're good now. See you later!

Today 15:47
| think | see Jon

Jamie, | mean

Board December Meeting

o The minutes were approved from the March 2025 meeting.
e Election of Interim Board Positions was determined — Mike
McMillen will be the Interim Secretary and James Guthridge
Interim Treasurer.
e Dues were all paid in 2024 and half already for 2025. d]
e Date, place, and time for the next Quarterly Board Meeting
will be Monday, September 15", 2025 at 6:00 p.m. via
Zoom.

Current Officers

Jamie Guthridge 2023 - 2025 President/Treasurer
303-483-3705
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